
Builder: HATTERAS

Year Built: 2015

Model: Motor Yacht

Price: PRICE ON APPLICATION

Location: United States

LOA: 45' 0" (13.72m)

Beam: 16' 6" (5.03m)

Max Draft: 4' 0" (1.22m)

HATTERAS 45EX — HATTERAS

Our experienced yacht broker, Andrey Shestakov, will help you choose and buy a yacht that best suits your needs
Hatteras 45EX — HATTERAS from our catalogue. Presently, at Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc., we have a wide variety of yachts available on
our sale’s list. We also work in close contact with all the big yacht manufacturers from all over the world.

If you would like to buy a yacht Hatteras 45EX — HATTERAS or would like help answering any questions concerning purchasing, selling or
chartering a yacht, please call +1(954)274-4435

https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/hatteras/ex/hatteras_45ex/2015/222834/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/builder/hatteras/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/hatteras/ex/hatteras_45ex/2015/222834/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/builder/hatteras/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/hatteras/ex/hatteras_45ex/2015/222834/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/our/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/our/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/popular-yacht/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/hatteras/ex/hatteras_45ex/2015/222834/
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SPECIFICATIONS

Overview

When you combine innovation with the best possible design, you create

something iconic. The new Hatteras 45 Express Series features versatility,

cutting-edge technology and legendary Hatteras performance, carried out

with meticulous craftsmanship.

Two distinct configurations, style options and features make this series

extremely versatile for the expert angler and inspired traveler alike. Choose

from the Sportfish version with a full tower, outriggers and an arsenal of

fishing amenities, or choose the Cruiser version with a low-profile exterior,

spacious cockpit, swim platform and bow pulpit, and a luxury yacht finish.

With the 45 Express Series, Hatteras has turned a dream into reality. But not

just any dream. Your dream.

 

Category: Motor Yacht Model Year: 2015

Year Built: 2015 Country: United States

Cockpit: Yes

Basic Information

LOA: 45' 0" (13.72m) Beam: 16' 6" (5.03m)

Max Draft: 4' 0" (1.22m)

Dimensions
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Water Capacity: 100 Gallons Holding Tank: 43 Gallons

Fuel Capacity: 800 Gallons

Speed, Capacities and Weight

Total Cabins: 1 Sleeps: 2

Total Heads: 1

Accommodations

Hull Material: Fiberglass

Hull and Deck Information

Engines: 2 Manufacturer: Caterpillar

Model: C-18A Engine Type: Inboard

Fuel Type: Diesel

Engine Information
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DETAILED INFORMATION

Exterior Finish / Construction

•  Isophthalic gel coat, all areas •   Blister resistant vinylester gel coat, white (hull) •  Painted hull
and superstructure for improved cosmetic & increased durability •  Painted boot stripe, black,
linear polyester polyurethane coating •  Decks, non-skid surfaces, polyurethane beads • 
Polymer/copper based anti-fouling bottom paint •   Solid fiberglass bottom with premium
vinylester resins • Hull sides of resin-infused composite construction with closed cell foam core
and premium vinylester resins •   Solid fiberglass longitudinal stringers •   Steel installed in
longitudinal stringers at key locations to create engine foundations •  Bulkheads, athwartship and
interior decks of resin infused composite construction using closed cell foam core •  Integrated
hardtop

Hardware & Miscellaneous

•  Wood interior bulkheads, cabinetry in rift cut white oak, flush filled satin finish •  All interior
hardware in polished chrome •  Anchor 6’ galvanized chain, 250’ anchor line •  Four polished
stainless-steel spring line cleats through bolted-in aluminum backing plate •  Two polished
stainless-steel bow cleats and chokes, stern cleats and hawse pipes, through bolted-in aluminum
backing plate •  Polished anodized aluminum rails on bow •  Deck plates for fuel and water fills
and waste pump out •  Bronze rudders •  Dual air horn •  Fog Bell •  Transom zinc •  Rudder
bearings and bronze struts with dripless seals •  Heavy duty couplings •  Alloy 22 high-strength
propeller shafts •  Dripless propeller shaft seals with spare seals •  Propellers, Nibral high
performance •  Stainless-steel trim tabs •  Windlass •  Underwater lights •  Life jackets (6) • 
Cushion •  Portable “drychem” fire extinguishers (4), U.L. approved type in compliance with
United States Coast Guard and ABYC Standards •  Braided nylon mooring lines (4) •  Fenders
(4)

Engine Compartment & Bilge

•  Painted polyurethane engine room and bilges •  Powder coated grab rails •  Rubber deck mat
between engines •   Insulation in engine room ceiling, for noise mitigation in main cabin •  AC
fluorescent lights •  DC Lights •  DC bilge blowers •   17kw freshwater cooled diesel generator •  
Twin diesel, freshwater-cooled main engines with electrically controlled marine gears, neutral
interlocks, and exhaust silencers •   Fiberglass fuel tank constructed with fire retardant resin
fittings •  United States Coast Guard type A1 U.L. Marine listed fuel lines •  Electrical fuel priming
pumps, main engines •   U.L. Marine listed duplex fuel filters/water separators, engines and
generators •  Water tank (100 gallons) •  Pressurized 24V DC freshwater pump •  One 230VAC
11-gallon electric water heater •  Sealed shower sump pump •  Bronze/chrome-plated ball valves
through bolted-in solid fiberglass on all underwater through hull fittings with electrical bonding
throughout •  Individual sea chests for each engine, and gensets •   Fiberglass rudder shelf
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bolted to steel plates in the stringers • Stainless-steel steering tie-bar with pivoting self aligning
ball joining connection at all cylinder and tie bar connections •  Shore water connection with
pressure-reducing valve •  24-volt DC bilge and sump pumps with heavy-duty float switches and
protective guards •  FM200 fixed fire-extinguishing system for engine compartment with
automatic and remote manual discharge and audible and visual discharge signals •  DC
voltmeter in DC distribution panel •  Oil change systems

Electrical Systems

•  Two 24 volt bank of heavy-duty, 12 volt marine batteries (4 AGM) mounted in a fire retardant
fiberglass box •  Bow Thrusters, 8HP •   Battery paralleling system with switch at helm • 
Automatic, 240 volt battery charger, 50/60Hz •   Battery control panel with fuses and magnetic
circuit breakers •  AC and DC distribution panels with magnetic circuit breakers •   AC switching
panel with source selector •  One 240 volt, 50 amp, retractable shoreline with ELCI ground fault
protection, overcurrent protection, and fail-safe galvanic isolator •   AC duplex outlet(s) with
ground fault protection •  DC LED lights and fixtures •  Air Conditioning, 18,000 BTU’s with
reverse cycle heating •  TV antenna, Omni-directional

Cockpit

•  Molded fiberglass mezzanine with seating •  Seating with cushions across upper mezzanine •  
Aluminum mounting plate installed for mounting fighting chair •  Bait and tackle center with
storage, gas spring, full-length stainless steel piano hinges and latch •  Bait tank molded into
transom, 56 gallons •  Tricolor courtesy lighting under gunwales •   Mezzanine with integrated
storage • Freezer under mezzanine seating •   Electric grill built into starboard bait and tackle
center •  Fish boxes (2), large capacity, insulated, flush in deck with macerator •  Hose and pistol-
grip nozzle and freshwater wash down outlet •  Hot and cold hand held shower •  Shore water
connections with pressure-reducing valve •   Saltwater wash down •  Insulated drink storage box
•   Icebox, fitted with gasketed lid, gas spring actuator, full length stainless steel piano hinges • 
Hatched, lazarette and fish boxes, heavy-duty, gasketed, draining, gutters, full-length stainless
steel piano hinge and latch •  Polished stainless-steel rod holders (4) •  Scruppers, in cockpit and
cockpit hatch drains •  Transom door with top gate, heavy duty polished stainless steel hardware
•  Stereo speakers (4) •  Bridge deck refrigerator •   Electric grill •  Helm deck refrigerator

Helm Console

•   Helm wheel, stainless steel •   Control station with all necessary switches •  Pod console with
steering wheel •  Hydraulic power-assisted steering •  One helm chair, one companion •  Fire and
bilge high water level alarms, audible •  Engine instrumental panel, custom with audible warning
system and hour meters •  Palm Beach single lever electronic controls •  Switch panels, custom,
stainless steel •  USB port, 110V outlet •  Helm console charger storage
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Galley

•   Synthetic wood-style flooring •  Fabric headliner installed on track system for service access •  
Dinette seating with storage underneath and wood table with stainless-steel pedestal •  Quartz
counter tops and storage cabinets made of finished wood •  AC under counter refrigerator and
freezer drawer units (1 refrigerator, 1 freezer) •  AC 2 burner ceramic cook top •  
Microwave/convection oven with stainless steel finish •   AC duplex outlet(s) with ground fault
protection •  DC LED under-counter lighting •  DC LED dimmable lighting overhead

Main Cabin

•   Synthetic wood-style flooring •  Fabric headliner on track system for service access •  DC LED
dimmable lighting •  Skylight (1) •  Access hatch to below deck equipment •  Foredeck hatch, with
retractable shade •  Fabric and coverings, fine selection throughout •  LED 32” class TV •  Stereo
home theater system with Blu-ray, blue tooth, USB port, Wi-fi and FM tuner •  HVAC control • 
Smoke and carbon monoxide detectors

Forward Stateroom

•  Fabric headliner on track system for service access •  Custom fabricated innerspring mattress
system •  Custom fitted sheet and mattress pad set •  Private head access •  20” class LED TV • 
Stereo with DVD player •  AC Duplex outlet(s) with ground fault protection •   Additional rod
storage in berth •  DC LED lighting •  HVAC control •  Smoke detector

Head Compartment

•  Synthetic wood-style flooring •  Fabric headliner on track system for service access •   Wall
coverings •  Quartz counter tops, back splash, with under mount sink •  Storage cabinet with
mirror above sink •   Base cabinet to match interior finish with storage •   Mirrored doors •  
Freshwater toilet •   Towel bar, towel ring, tissue holder, rob hook •  AC recirculating fan •   AC
duplex outlet(s) with ground fault protection •  DC LED Lighting •  Holding tank monitoring system
•  HVAC control •  Smoke and carbon monoxide detectors

Exclusions

Owner's personal belongings.

Disclaimer

The Company offers the details of this vessel or yacht in good faith but cannot guarantee or
warrant the accuracy of this information nor warrant the condition of the vessel. A buyer should
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instruct his representatives, agents, or his surveyors, to investigate such details as the buyer
desires validated. This vessel or yacht is offered subject to prior sale, price change, or withdrawal
without notice.
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PHOTOS
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CONTACTS

Andrey Shestakov, leading yacht broker of the sales department of Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc.
Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc., the official representative of the Miami/Fort Lauderdale FL
headquarters.

Email:
andrey@shestakovyachtsales.com

Web: shestakovyachtsales.com/en/

Contact details

USA: +1(954)274-4435

Telephones

Monday – Saturday: 9:00 - 21:00 EDT Sunday: closed

Office hours

Harbour Towne Marina, 850 NE 3rd St,
STE 213, Dania, FL 33004

Address
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