
Builder: OFFSHORE YACHTS

Year Built: 1997

Model: Motor Yacht

Price: PRICE ON APPLICATION

Location: United States

LOA: 58' 0" (17.68m)

Beam: 16' 10" (5.13m)

Max Draft: 5' 0" (1.52m)

Cruise Speed: 16 Kts. (18 MPH)

Max Speed: 20 Kts. (23 MPH)

CANDIDE — OFFSHORE YACHTS

Our experienced yacht broker, Andrey Shestakov, will help you choose and buy a yacht that best suits your needs
Candide — OFFSHORE YACHTS from our catalogue. Presently, at Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc., we have a wide variety of yachts
available on our sale’s list. We also work in close contact with all the big yacht manufacturers from all over the world.

If you would like to buy a yacht Candide — OFFSHORE YACHTS or would like help answering any questions concerning purchasing, selling
or chartering a yacht, please call +1(954)274-4435

https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/offshore_yachts/pilothouse/candide/1997/258382/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/builder/offshore_yachts/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/offshore_yachts/pilothouse/candide/1997/258382/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/builder/offshore_yachts/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/boat/offshore_yachts/pilothouse/candide/1997/258382/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/our/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/yachts-for-sale/our/
https://shestakovyachtsales.com/en/popular-yacht/
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SPECIFICATIONS

Overview

PRELIMINARY LISTING - SUBJECT TO OWNER/CAPTAIN REVIEW AND CHANGES!

The reputation of the Bill Crealock designed Offshore series of motoryachts has created a well
deserved following of loyal owners over decades of serious cruising. CANDIDE has been owned
by three fastidious owners, who receive high marks for proper care and maintenance of the
vessel.The replacement of the main engines in 2002, installation of the keel extension, prop
pockets, raised bulwarks forward, plus numerous updates in the past years make this listing one
to consider...In short, cruising improvements that bring a 1997 well maintained vessel up to the
condition of many later model designs available on the market today.

Category: Motor Yacht Sub Category: Pilothouse

Model Year: 1997 Year Built: 1997

Country: United States Registration #: 1060247

Vessel Top: Bimini Top

Basic Information

LOA: 58' 0" (17.68m) Beam: 16' 10" (5.13m)

Max Draft: 5' 0" (1.52m)

Dimensions

Cruise Speed: 16 Kts. (18 MPH) Max Speed: 20 Kts. (23 MPH)

Displacement: 82000 Pounds Water Capacity: 450 Gallons

Fuel Capacity: 1000 Gallons

Speed, Capacities and Weight
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Total Cabins: 3 Total Heads: 2

Accommodations

Hull Material: Fiberglass Hull Designer: Bill Crealock

Hull and Deck Information

Engines: 2 Manufacturer: Caterpillar

Model: 3196 Engine Type: Inboard

Fuel Type: Diesel

Engine Information
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DETAILED INFORMATION

Design Features

Deep and finely veed forefoot, with flared bow sections and radiused spray rails. Fully covered
walk around side decks with deep, safe bulwarks. Both upper and lower rub rails (lower capped
with stainless steel trim) Low silhouette and center of gravity. Flush pilothouse exterior doors for
watertight seal. Large, low profile windows for excellent sit-down visibility from within the vessel.
All exterior stainless steel is grade 316 and there is no exterior aluminum used on the vessel. 

Accommodations

Main Salon: (Layout attached) Double aft sliding doors with full glass windows. Engine room
access from forward in salon, as well as on the aft deck, before the salon entrance doors.
TV/entertainment center DVD, audio/visual controller, new sub-woofer, Surround Sound, and
Satellite DirecTV receiver. U-shaped settee with expanding hi-lo table to port and new Visio 50"
pop-up TV to starboard. Storage lockers forward to starboard and across from the galley. Private
stairway down to owners stateroom is to starboard forward 

Galley - Salon Level, to Port

Teak and Corian counter tops (2) Sub-Zero under the counter refrigerators and (1) Sub-Zero
freezer with ice maker Kenyon 3-burner ceramic stove top Double stainless sinks with disposal
Filtered under sink R.O. filter for water and icemaker Sharp microwave/convection oven Pass-
through to pilothouse and dinette seating Teak and holly floor 

Master Stateroom

Located midship, with King size bed Abundant teak drawers, bookshelves, and cabinetry
throughout Ensuite head and stall shower 

VIP Stateroom, Forward

Full size berth Overhead deck hatch and stainless hull ports for ventilation Numerous drawers
and storage lockers Head and shower, shared with port side stateroom 

Guest Stateroom, Port

Raised single berth with large storage under Washer/dryer (over & under) Stainless port light
Numerous drawers and storage lockers Head and shower, shared with forward VIP stateroom 
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Pilothouse

Port and starboard doors to side decks Stairway up to flybridge Pass-through to galley
Dinette/chart table with L-shaped seating Helm chair that adjusts also to the table seating Teak &
holly sole Large storage lockers and drawers at lower helm area 

Flybridge

2004 Zodiac YL rigid bottom dinghy with 40 HP Yamaha engine (serviced 08/2019)L-shaped
seating area to port with two adjustable tablesHelm and companion chairsWet bar with Norcold
refrigeratorRecent Bimini top with plexiglass windshield and canvas covers throughoutMarQuipt
1500# davit with new hydraulic cylinder and remote controlStainless surround hand
railsStainless dinghy cradleNew stereo speakers (2015) 

Cockpit

Helm station with bow thruster and engine controls Sink and storage locker to port Teak decks
and covering boards Full cockpit sun shade recently installed Deck wash down and shower
controls Transom door to swim platform Engine room and lazarette access New stereo speakers
(2015) 

Mechanical/Engine Room Equipment

In 2002 new Cat. 3196 engines were installed with the latest Cat upgrades. (2,250 hours total
time as of September 1, 2019) Oil/filter change and transmission service (January 2019) New
Caterpillar engine hoses (11/2015) New motor mounts 7/15, and coolers serviced at 2000 hours
ZF transmissions with 2 1/2-inch shafts Bennett trim tabs Spare 4 blade props Wesmar 24 Volt
bow thruster Wesmar hydraulic stabilizers (Serviced 01/2019 with new bearings and seals)
Marine Air 65,000 BTU 5 zone A/C reverse cycle system, flushed annually - updated 2018/2019
800 GPD Offshore Marine Labs water maker with new membranes Halon 1000 automatic fire
system Oil change system 180 GPH fuel polishing system Racor fuel filters Numerous spare
cruising parts for mechanical, plumbing, A/C, water maker, and electrical systems 

Electronics

Yacht Controller (new 2015) with bow thruster and windlass controlGost security monitoring
systemTwo Garmin 7212 chart plotters, one in pilot house, one on fly bridge. (updated
2019)Garmin HD 6 ' radarRaytheon autopilot with Gyro feedBig Bay HD 15" monitor in
pilothouse (2013)ICOM 710 SSB tuner with filters (2013)Standard Horizon VHF with AIS in
pilothouse (2013)KVH 4 satellite dish (2013)ICOM VHF radio on fly bridgeRaymarine Tri-Data
and transducer (2015)Wi-Fi extender (2013)Cell phone boosterXM radioIntercom
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throughoutRemote cameras, one in engine room, one in cockpitACR spot light with two station
controls 

Electrical

12 KW Northern Lights Generator (3840 hrs. September 2019) 8 KW Northern Lights Generator
(3856 hrs. September 2019) (2) Inverter/chargers, (3000-watt house, 2500-watt backup) 2 x 50-
amp shore power inlets, forward and aft in cockpit & 2/50-amp 30' shore cords 130-amp 12-volt
alternators with one on starboard engine (Balmar with remote amp gauge in pilothouse) (12)
AGM house batteries - replaced 06/2019 Engine batteries 2017 

Exterior, Hull, Deck

New bottom paint January 20192004 Zodiac YL rigid bottom dinghy with 40 HP Yamaha engine
(serviced August 2019)Maxwell windlass88 lb. Delta with chain & rode55 lb. Delta with chain &
rode7 ft. MarQuipt tide ride stairsCustom folding reclining chairs on foredeckThree station
Hynautic steeringMarQuipt davit 1500 lbs. with new hydraulic cylinder and remote controlLED
deck lights and anchor lightWindshield wipersMesh window sun coversFishing rod
holderNumerous dock lines, (8) fenders, canvas covers, and Coast Guard safety items 

Exclusions

Kayak, plus the owner’s personal items, with list of details to be furnished prior to survey of the
vessel. 

Exclusions

Owner's personal belongings.

Disclaimer

The Company offers the details of this vessel or yacht in good faith but cannot guarantee or
warrant the accuracy of this information nor warrant the condition of the vessel. A buyer should
instruct his representatives, agents, or his surveyors, to investigate such details as the buyer
desires validated. This vessel or yacht is offered subject to prior sale, price change, or withdrawal
without notice.
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PHOTOS
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CONTACTS

Andrey Shestakov, leading yacht broker of the sales department of Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc.
Shestakov Yacht Sales Inc., the official representative of the Miami/Fort Lauderdale FL
headquarters.

Email:
andrey@shestakovyachtsales.com

Web: shestakovyachtsales.com/en/

Contact details

USA: +1(954)274-4435

Telephones

Monday – Saturday: 9:00 - 21:00 EDT Sunday: closed

Office hours

Harbour Towne Marina, 850 NE 3rd St,
STE 213, Dania, FL 33004

Address
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